

JEFFERSON COLLEGE RFP #1904001

ROOF REPLACEMENT BID TAB

CONTRACTOR	BARTCH	FREDERIC	GEISSLER	LAKESIDE	TRIAD
	<i>Bridgeton, MO</i>	<i>St. Louis, MO</i>	<i>Belleville, IL</i>	<i>Collinsville, IL</i>	<i>Blue Spring, MO</i>
Bid Bond	X	X	X	X	X
Addendum I Acknowledgement	X	X	X	X	X
Addenda II Acknowledgement	X	X	X	X	X
EPDM ROOF REPLACEMENT					
A. Field House	\$464,151.00	\$588,947.00	\$388,360.00	\$577,500.00	NO BID
B. Student Center	\$108,160.00	\$164,201.00	\$107,860.00	\$111,000.00	NO BID
Approved EPDM Roof System	X	X	X	X	
Contingency	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00
TOTAL	\$582,311.00	\$763,148.00	\$506,220.00	\$698,500.00	NO BID
ALTERNATES					
1000 Sq. Ft. of Tuckpointing FH Roof	\$17.50/SQ FT	\$35.00/SQ FT	\$25.00/SQ FT	\$21.00/SQ FT	NO BID
Lineal Foot Price for Replacement of Rotten or Det. Existing Nailers	\$5.00/L FT	\$2.75/L FT	\$4.00/L FT	\$3.50/ L FT	NO BID
SHINGLE ROOF REPLACEMENT					
A. Child Development Center	\$13,700.00	\$21,657.00	\$13,300.00	NO BID	\$22,750.00
B. Viking Woods Housing	\$33,200.00	\$43,987.00	\$34,700.00	NO BID	\$43,725.00
TOTAL	\$46,900.00	\$65,644.00	\$48,000.00	NO BID	\$66,475.00
ALTERNATE					
Cost for Certain Teed Landmark AR: Lifetime Limited Warranty, Option for 5-Star Coverage or Approved Equal	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,380.00	NO BID	\$6,500.00